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1) Interested in working for the International Office? We’re hiring! 

 
The BeBuddy and Housing Team is looking for a student assistant to support in the 
orientation period with administrative and organizational tasks in the BeBuddy program, the 
Housing Advice Service and, if need be, the Welcome Week for new international students 
with 10 hours/week from mid-August to mid-November 2021. Please note that German 
proficiency (C1 level) is absolutely necessary for this job opening.  
 
Please click here for all relevant information about the job offer. We look forward to receive 
your applications  
 
 
2) The big picture of the consulting 

 
The „Aachen Consulting Club e.V.“ is founded by a diverse team of international and local 
students studying at the RWTH Aachen University. The student association provides 
workshops, training and networking opportunities for students in the region of Aachen; 
hence, giving them a competitive edge in joining global and local consulting companies. All 
students interested in establishing a career in the consulting field are welcome to join the 
events, develop desired skillsets and their network and enhance their experience on the 
campus. 
Students from all disciplines are welcome, especially engineering students! The club also 
recruits self-motivated and creative problem-solvers to their team. Grab this chance to join 
them on this exciting journey of being part of a diverse and international student association 
in Aachen!   
You want to learn more about the „Aachen Consulting Club e.V.“? Feel free to take a look at 
their Instagram (@aachenconsultingclub) and LinkedIn account (Aachen Consulting Club 
e.V.), get inspired and uncover the big picture of the consulting.  
 
 
 
 

https://www.rwth-aachen.de/cms/root/Die-RWTH/Arbeiten-an-der-RWTH/Jobboerse/~kbag/JOB-Einzelansicht/file/34038/?fbclid=IwAR0eR3QDQpxWyJwAks7cPADGNQSLOjglvX-Q0PZ-wr-1egY8MBFjel_Qw7E


 

  
3) To all international students: Interested in the DAAD Scholarship for Completing 

Studies and the Scholarship for Particularly Involved International Students? 
 

We would like to inform you that the application period for the Scholarship for Completing 
Studies and the Scholarship for Particularly Involved International Students is ongoing (until 
31st of May 2021). 
Both scholarships are awarded by the International Office with funds from the DAAD and 
target international students who have a good or very good academic performance and 
engage themselves in the international context of the university. 
Please find more information regarding eligibility and the application procedure here: 
 
www.rwth-aachen.de/stipendium-engagierte 
www.rwth-aachen.de/studienabschluss-stipendium 
 
The International Office will also offer a weekly consultation hour for scholarship applicants 
on Zoom: 
Every Wednesday in May from 3 – 4pm: 
https://rwth.zoom.us/j/95834223690?pwd=Q1A0a2ZhdHFUR3RHMkVheXVJcEtxUT09 
 
Meeting-ID: 958 3422 3690 
Kenncode: 618081 
 
 
4) Digital Career Day Local Heroes (Tuesday, June 1st) 

 
Good things are often so close - that's why the RWTH Career Center is offering this Digital 
Career Day as an opportunity to get to know up to six exciting companies from the Aachen 
region and make direct contact with the decision-makers. Get to know exciting companies 
from the Aachen area in short presentations and then talk to representatives of the 
companies in the Q&A sessions about internships or starting a career and get your own 
impression of the working environment and the companies. The event is aimed at students 
and graduates of all disciplines and will be held via Zoom. 
The event is free of charge. 
 
Date: June 1st, 4pm-6.30 pm 
Here, you can find more information.  
 

https://www.rwth-aachen.de/go/id/nolnh?%23aaaaaaaaaanpbhk


 

  
5) Re-entry Coaching for Students With Long-Term Illnesses – WieLaS  

You are studying at RWTH Aachen University and you had to interrupt your studies for a 
longer period of time due to illness or family issues? Or you can foresee being in this 
situation in the future? Are you wondering how you can resume your studies under these 
conditions? 

The Student Advice Centre would like to support you with longer-term coaching to help you 
get settled back into your studies. This coaching is based on your individual needs, which are 
clarified with you at the beginning. Your coach will regularly held short backup meetings 
throughout the semester with you so you will have a continued guidance and a final meeting 
at the end of the semester. Together with you, your coach will establish a strategy, draw up a 
realistic plan of action, and support you in implementing it. 

You are welcome to call and ask any questions you have during the WieLaS telephone 
consultation hours: Tuesdays from 10 to 11 am at +49 241 80 99409.Or click here for more 
information. 

 

Enjoy the May and the spring around you!  

Dominika Dudzik, Wen Wei and Haiyan Saadi from the BeBuddy Team 

PS: You can also follow us on Facebook  
 
In case you want to unsubscribe, please write a short email to bebuddy@rwth-aachen.de 

mailto:https://www.rwth-aachen.de/cms/root/Studium/Beratung-Hilfe/Beratung-und-Angebote-fuer-Studierende/~nzyqj/Wiedereinstiegscoaching-fuer-langzeiterk/?lidx=1
https://www.facebook.com/groups/462299100546664/?fref=ts
mailto:bebuddy@rwth-aachen.de

